Ticket Booked by the Jungle
> travels
> > India Pvt Ltd Shillong, at their Guwahaty Office for my Visit to France:
> > Issued by AIRINDIA  VALIDONAIS2ONLYPNR H9X5Q
> >                                  NAME of Passenger   (Not Transferable)
> BDDC
> > AOS-825
> >                                  SHANKARAPADI/ARAVAMUDANMR
> > Ticket No: 3230751208 of Conjuction Ticket ..208/...209    Date of
issue:
> 11 AUG 2004
> > GUWAHATI       S2   112 W      03SEP        1540  OK
> > DELHI                 AI   164  K      04SEP        0230  OK
> > -----------------------------------------------------------
> > Ticket No: 3230751209 of Conjunction Ticket ..208/..209   Dtae of Issue:
> 11
> > AUG 2004
> > MUMBAI           AI    145 K      04SEP         0720  OK
> > PARIS                AI    144 L       13SEP         1130  OK
> > MUMBAI           AI    165 L       14SEP         0330  OK
> > DELHI                S2    111W      14SEP         1000   OK
> > ---------------------------------------------------------- 
> >                         Total Fare   INR 46945    Control No:22470510052

Dr.S.Aravamudhan  [COPY of Email sent to webmaster@france-in-india.org 

Cc: EENC/AMPERE 2004 Conference   jean-paul.amoureux@univ-lille1.fr ]

Embassy of France in India
VISA Officer
2/50-E Shantipath
Chanakyapuri
New Delhi 110 021
Tel: 91 (11) 2611 8790
Fax: 91 (11) 2687 2305

Sir/Madam,
 

With reference to the Letter sent by me by POST I wish to state the following:
 

As per my letter ATTACHED herewith and my previous Fax messages, I had applied for the required Short stay VISA and the Travel Agency at Shillong, M/S Jungle Travels India Pvt. Ltd., ensured to have my application submitted at the French Embassy, New Delhi and duly collect my passport therafter with the 'C'-VISA [No: F51700064 issued on 18-08-2004] Endorsed on page 11  in my Indian National passport No: B5569652. I received this Document duly from the Travel Agency. I shall convey my travel schedules for the visit to Lille, France to the organizers of the Conference with the provisions made vide the Flight ticket No: 3230751208/209 (conjunction ticket) with  PNR H9X5Q Issued by AIRINDIA on 11th August 2004, at Jungle travels India Pvt. Ltd., Guwahati. Departure Delhi 4th SEP 2004 AI 164 K  transit MUMBAI Change flight AI 145 Arrival PARIS on 4th SEP 2004. Departure PARIS 13th SEP AI 144 L transit MUMBAI Change flight AI 165 L Arrival DELHI 14th SEP 2004.
VISA valid for ETATS SCHENGEN from 18-08-2004 until 17-11-2004 with number of entries MULT duration of stay 30days.
Since the Accommodation Fees have been paid with the registartion fee, I intend to travel with a minimum of 100 Euro in cash and I have to bare the Train Fare in France fror the sector PARIS-LILLE-PARIS with the food expenses.
Previuos effort to send message at this Webmaster@france-in-india.org was returned with message probably the inbox was full!
My URL: http://geocities.com/saravamudhan1944/eenc_ampere_lille.html 

truely,
 

ARAVAMUDHAN, Sankarampadi
to be a Participant in the Conference as per http://www.nmr2004.com 
Dr.S.Aravamudhan

Sr.Lecturer

Department of Chemistry

North Eastern Hill University

PO NEHU Campus Mawkynroh Umshing

East Khasi Hills District

Shillong 793022 Meghalaya

Residence: Qtr.No.L-46 NEHU Campus
 

 
----- Original Message ----- 

From: Dr.S.Aravamudhan 

To: EENC/AMPERE 2004 Conference 

Sent: Monday, August 30, 2004 10:22 AM

Subject: About my arrival schedules

 
Normally the TGV Lille-Paris (go and return) may approximately cost 80 Euros (c.a. 100$).
In Lille, you will have very few things to spend.
Nevertheless, 100$ may slightly be not enough.
150$ should be mores secure.
best   JP Amoureux 

Sirs:
Please note that my Flight Schedules are as follows and I shall be arriving in Paris on 4th September 2004 in the afternoon.
The two incoming and outgoing flights at PARIS for which I have the booking are indicated in RED below.
I shall be travelling with a currency of US $100/- and at Paris/Lille I have to bare the expenses for train/metro tickets and food expenses. 
If this amount would not be enough I may be instructed accordingly before 2nd September 2004 to make the necessary provisions for the currency.
I have viewed the schedule for the POSTER Sessions and my POSTER is scheduled as PO141.
As I found the size of the poster Boards to be 1m (height)x 2m(width) , I have my poster materials all on A4 size sheets 
and intend put them up 3 Sheets(lengthwise) x 8 Sheets (widthwise) 
some of these POSTER Sheets would be possibly available from my webpage URL; 
http://geocities.com/saravamudhan1944/eenc_ampere_lille.html - 
soon before I start out from Shillong on the 3rd September.
Sincerely,
S.Aravamudhan
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